
NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

A.1 Initial clearing (Forestry Mowing) & stump herbicide treatment ACRE 31.2 2500.00 $78,000.00 $2,939.00 $91,696.80 no bid no bid

A.2 Resprout treatment ACRE 31.2 300.00 $9,360.00 $712.49 $22,229.69 no bid no bid

$87,360.00 $113,926.49 no bid

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

B.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment; includes treatment of all individually marked trees for removal ACRE 2.6 5000.00 $13,000.00 no bid $0.00 $4,338.46 $11,280.00 no bid no bid

B.2 Brush removal ACRE 2.6 800.00 $2,080.00 $0.00 $3,700.00 $9,620.00 no bid no bid

B.3 Resprout treatment ACRE 2.6 545.00 $1,417.00 $0.00 $850.00 $2,210.00 no bid no bid

$16,497.00 $0.00 $23,110.00 no bid

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

C.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment ACRE 1.9 6450.00 $12,255.00 no bid $0.00 $6,760.00 $12,844.00 $2,940.00 $5,586.00

C.2 Brush removal via brushpile burning or chipping/offsite disposal ACRE 1.9 500.00 $950.00 $0.00 $4,420.00 $8,398.00 $840.00 $1,596.00

C.3 Brush removal via chipping and leaving on-site ACRE 1.9 500.00 $950.00 $0.00 $3,315.00 $6,298.50 no bid no bid

C.4 Resprout treatment ACRE 1.9 800.00 $1,520.00 $0.00 $935.00 $1,776.50 $420.00 $798.00

$15,675.00 $0.00 $29,317.00 $7,980.00

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

CA.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment ACRE 0.34 3450.00 $1,173.00 no bid $0.00 $6,760.00 $2,298.40 $2,940.00 $999.60

CA.2 Brush removal via brushpile burning or chipping/offsite disposal ACRE 0.34 1200.00 $408.00 $0.00 $4,420.00 $1,502.80 $840.00 $285.60

CA.3 Brush removal via chipping and leaving on-site ACRE 0.34 1200.00 $408.00 $0.00 $3,770.00 $1,281.80 no bid no bid

CA.4 Resprout treatment ACRE 0.34 1000.00 $340.00 $0.00 $2,040.00 $693.60 $420.00 $142.80

$2,329.00 $0.00 $5,776.60 $1,428.00

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

D.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment ACRE 2.3 8400.00 $19,320.00 no bid $0.00 $4,539.13 $10,440.00 $4,830.00 $11,109.00

D.2 Brush removal ACRE 2.3 750.00 $1,725.00 $0.00 $2,600.00 $5,980.00 $1,380.00 $3,174.00

D.3 Resprout treatment ACRE 2.3 450.00 $1,035.00 $0.00 $1,190.00 $2,737.00 $690.00 $1,587.00

$22,080.00 $0.00 $19,157.00 $15,870.00

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

E.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment ACRE 0.5 18000.00 $9,000.00 no bid $0.00 $1,680.00 $840.00

E.2 Brush removal ACRE 0.5 3500.00 $1,750.00 $0.00 $560.00 $280.00

E.3 Resprout treatment ACRE 0.5 3500.00 $1,750.00 $0.00 $280.00 $140.00

E.4 Check remaining property for buckthorn and remove/treat AREA 1 NA NA NA $140.00

$12,500.00 $0.00 $1,400.00

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE

F.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment SITE 1 $2,000.00 no bid $0.00 $857.50

F.2 Brush removal SITE 1 $500.00 $0.00 $245.00

F.3 Resprout treatment SITE 1 $500.00 $0.00 $122.50

$3,000.00 $0.00 $1,225.00

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE

FA.1 Removal and disposal of conifer tree SITE 1 $200.00 no bid $0.00 no bid

$200.00 $0.00 no bid

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE

G.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment; includes treatment of all previously cut stumps – North Area/Front Yard SITE 1 $250.00 no bid $0.00 no bid

G.2 Brush removal – North Area/Front Yard SITE 1 $250.00 $0.00 no bid

G.3 Resprout treatment – North Area/Front Yard SITE 1 $250.00 $0.00 no bid

G.4 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment – South Area/Back Yard Property Line SITE 1 $250.00 $0.00 no bid

G.5 Brush removal – South Area/Back Yard Property Line SITE 1 $250.00 $0.00 no bid

G.6 Resprout treatment – South Area/Back Yard Property Line SITE 1 $250.00 $0.00 no bid

$1,500.00 $0.00 no bid

PROJECT AREA “B” (Lake Forest Academy)

PROJECT AREA “C” (Nature’s Haven – 12540 Safford Ave)

PROJECT AREA “C” (12568 Foster Ave) - BID ADDITION  

PROJECT AREA “D” (122 N. Skokie Highway)

PROJECT AREA “E” (316 & 318 Forest Knoll)

PROJECT AREA “F” (415 Adelphia)

PROJECT AREA “F” (415 Adelphia – Conifer Removal) - BID ADDITION 

PROJECT AREA “G” (714 Smith)

NATIVE RESTORATION 

SERVICES

A1.  PROJECT AREA “A” (Lake County Forest Preserves)

CLEAN CUT TREE 

SERVICE

INTEGRATED LAKES 

MANAGEMENT
MCGINTY BROS

Site List



NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

H.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment ACRE 0.13 6250.00 $812.50 no bid $0.00 $18,576.92 $2,415.00

H.2 Brush removal ACRE 0.13 6250.00 $812.50 $0.00 $5,307.69 $690.00

H.3 Resprout treatment ACRE 0.13 4500.00 $585.00 $0.00 $2,653.85 $345.00

$2,210.00 $0.00 $3,450.00

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

I.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment ACRE 0.13 10250.00 $1,332.50 no bid $0.00 $31,123.01 $4,045.99

I.2 Brush removal ACRE 0.13 10250.00 $1,332.50 $0.00 $8,892.31 $1,156.00

I.3 Resprout treatment ACRE 0.13 4125.00 $536.25 $0.00 $4,446.15 $578.00

$3,201.25 $0.00 $5,779.99

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE

J.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment – Mapped Areas SITE 1 $1,500.00 no bid $0.00 $631.50

J.2 Brush removal – Mapped Areas SITE 1 $150.00 $0.00 $209.00

J.3 Resprout treatment – Mapped Areas SITE 1 $150.00 $0.00 $104.50

J.4 Check remaining property for buckthorn and remove/treat AREA 1 NA NA NA $100.00

$1,800.00 $0.00 $1,045.00

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE

K.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment SITE 1 $1,500.00 no bid $0.00 no bid no bid

K.2 Brush removal SITE 1 $150.00 $0.00 no bid no bid

K.3 Resprout treatment SITE 1 $150.00 $0.00 no bid no bid

$1,800.00 $0.00 no bid

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

L.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment; includes conifers on east side of pond ACRE 1.09 25000.00 $27,250.00 no bid $0.00 $2,939.45 $3,204.00

L.2 Brush removal ACRE 1.09 1400.00 $1,526.00 $0.00 $840.00 $915.60

L.3 Resprout treatment ACRE 1.09 1400.00 $1,526.00 $0.00 $420.00 $457.80

$30,302.00 $0.00 $4,577.40

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

LA.1 Removal and disposal of dead oak tree EACH 3 725.00 $2,175.00 no bid $0.00 no bid no bid

$2,175.00 $0.00 no bid

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

M1.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment ACRE 0.21 6350.00 $1,333.50 no bid $0.00 no bid no bid

M1.2 Brush removal ACRE 0.21 6300.00 $1,323.00 $0.00 no bid no bid

M1.3 Resprout treatment ACRE 0.21 4500.00 $945.00 $0.00 no bid no bid

$3,601.50 $0.00 no bid

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

M2.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment ACRE 0.04 57500.00 $2,300.00 no bid $0.00 no bid no bid

M2.2 Brush removal ACRE 0.04 7500.00 $300.00 $0.00 no bid no bid

M2.3 Resprout treatment ACRE 0.04 7500.00 $300.00 $0.00 no bid no bid

$2,900.00 $0.00 no bid

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

M3.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment ACRE 0.01 250000.00 $2,500.00 no bid $0.00 no bid no bid

M3.2 Brush removal ACRE 0.01 20000.00 $200.00 $0.00 no bid no bid

M3.3 Resprout treatment ACRE 0.01 20000.00 $200.00 $0.00 no bid no bid

$2,900.00 $0.00 no bid

NO EXT. PRICE UNIT QTY EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE

M3A.1 Removal and disposal of dead tree SITE 1 NA $700.00 NA no bid NA NA no bid

$700.00 $0.00 no bid

PROJECT AREA “M3” (1691 Elderberry) - BID ADDITION 

PROJECT AREA “L” (745 Sunrise – Dead Oak Removal) - BID ADDITION 

PROJECT AREA M: WILLOW LAKE HOA, LAKE FOREST

PROJECT AREA “M2” (1685 Elderberry)

PROJECT AREA “M3” (1691 Elderberry)

PROJECT AREA “M1” (1681 Elderberry)

PROJECT AREA “H” (1002 Quassey)

PROJECT AREA “I” (1125 Foster)

PROJECT AREA “J” (1322 Deerpath)

PROJECT AREA “K” (1005 Burris)

PROJECT AREA “L” (745 Sunrise)



NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

M4.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment ACRE 0.06 60000.00 $3,600.00 no bid $0.00 $17,383.33 $1,043.00

M4.2 Brush removal ACRE 0.06 7500.00 $450.00 $0.00 $4,966.66 $298.00

M4.3 Resprout treatment ACRE 0.06 7500.00 $450.00 $0.00 $2,483.33 $149.00

$4,500.00 $0.00 $1,490.00

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

M4A.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment ACRE 0.29 25000.00 $7,250.00 no bid $0.00 $7,000.00 $2,030.00

M4A.2 Brush removal ACRE 0.29 3764.00 $1,091.56 $0.00 $2,000.00 $580.00

M4A.3 Resprout treatment ACRE 0.29 4000.00 $1,160.00 $0.00 $1,000.00 $290.00

$9,501.56 $0.00 $2,900.00

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

M5.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment ACRE 0.04 110000.00 $4,400.00 no bid $0.00 $21,000.00 $840.00

M5.2 Brush removal ACRE 0.04 14000.00 $560.00 $0.00 $6,000.00 $240.00

M5.3 Resprout treatment ACRE 0.04 14000.00 $560.00 $0.00 $3,000.00 $120.00

$5,520.00 $0.00 $1,200.00

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

M5A.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment ACRE 0.24 33667.00 $8,080.08 no bid $0.00 no bid no bid

M5A.2 Brush removal ACRE 0.24 4000.00 $960.00 $0.00 no bid no bid

M5A.3 Resprout treatment ACRE 0.24 4000.00 $960.00 $0.00 no bid no bid

$10,000.08 $0.00 no bid

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE

M6.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment SITE 1 $2,000.00 no bid $0.00 $504.00

M6.2 Brush removal SITE 1 $250.00 $0.00 $144.00

M6.3 Resprout treatment SITE 1 $250.00 $0.00 $72.00

$2,500.00 $0.00 $720.00

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

M6A1.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment ACRE 0.05 70000.00 $3,500.00 no bid $0.00 $18,886.00 $944.30

M6A1.2 Brush removal ACRE 0.05 10000.00 $500.00 $0.00 $5,396.00 $269.80

M6A1.3 Resprout treatment ACRE 0.05 10000.00 $500.00 $0.00 $2,698.00 $134.90

$4,500.00 $0.00 $1,349.00

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

M6A2.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment ACRE 0.13 50000.00 $6,500.00 no bid $0.00 $13,461.54 $1,750.00

M6A2.2 Brush removal ACRE 0.13 3850.00 $500.50 $0.00 $3,846.15 $500.00

M6A2.3 Resprout treatment ACRE 0.13 3850.00 $500.50 $0.00 $1,923.08 $250.00

$7,501.00 $0.00 $2,500.00

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

M7.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment; includes removal of adjacent ash tree ACRE 0.09 35400.00 $3,186.00 no bid $0.00 no bid no bid

M7.2 Brush removal ACRE 0.09 1750.00 $157.50 $0.00 no bid no bid

M7.3 Resprout treatment ACRE 0.09 1750.00 $157.50 $0.00 no bid no bid

$3,501.00 $0.00 no bid

DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE

M7A.1 Removal, disposal, and herbicide treatments for 2 elm trees SITE 1 $2,800.00 NA no bid NA NA no bid

$2,800.00 $0.00 no bid

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

M9.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment ACRE 0.05 98000.00 $4,900.00 no bid $0.00 no bid no bid

M9.2 Brush removal ACRE 0.05 10000.00 $500.00 $0.00 no bid no bid

M9.3 Resprout treatment ACRE 0.05 10000.00 $500.00 $0.00 no bid no bid

$5,900.00 $0.00 no bid

PROJECT AREA “M7” (1760 Westbridge) - BID ADDITION 

PROJECT AREA “M9” (1796 Westbridge)

PROJECT AREA “M6” (1756 Westbridge) - BID ADDITION 1

PROJECT AREA “M6” (1756 Westbridge) - BID ADDITION 2

PROJECT AREA “M7” (1760 Westbridge)

PROJECT AREA “M5” (1750 Westbridge) - BID ADDITION 

PROJECT AREA “M6” (1756 Westbridge)

PROJECT AREA “M4” (1746 Westbridge)

PROJECT AREA “M4” (1746 Westbridge) - BID ADDITION

PROJECT AREA “M5” (1750 Westbridge)



NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

M10.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment ACRE 0.14 40000.00 $5,600.00 no bid $0.00 $6,700.00 $938.00

M10.2 Brush removal ACRE 0.14 6000.00 $840.00 $0.00 $1,914.29 $268.00

M10.3 Resprout treatment ACRE 0.14 6000.00 $840.00 $0.00 $957.14 $134.00

$7,280.00 $0.00 $1,340.00

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

M10A.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment ACRE 0.29 30000.00 $8,700.00 no bid $0.00 no bid no bid

M10A.2 Brush removal ACRE 0.29 6000.00 $1,740.00 $0.00 no bid no bid

M10A.3 Resprout treatment ACRE 0.29 6000.00 $1,740.00 $0.00 no bid no bid

$12,180.00 $0.00 no bid

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE COST PER UNIT EXT. PRICE

N.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment ACRE 0.36 39500.00 $14,220.00 no bid $0.00 $5,600.00 $2,016.00

N.2 Brush removal ACRE 0.36 6000.00 $2,160.00 $0.00 $1,600.00 $576.00

N.3 Resprout treatment ACRE 0.36 4500.00 $1,620.00 $0.00 $800.00 $288.00

$18,000.00 $0.00 $2,880.00

NO DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE EXT. PRICE

O.1 Initial clearing & stump herbicide treatment; all areas SITE 1 $6,000.00 no bid $0.00 $983.50

O.2 Brush removal; all areas SITE 1 $750.00 $0.00 $281.00

O.3 Resprout treatment; all areas SITE 1 $750.00 $0.00 $140.50

$7,500.00 $0.00 $1,405.00

PROJECT AREA “O” (815 Burris)

PROJECT AREA “M10” (HOA Common Area)

PROJECT AREA “M10” (HOA Common Area) - BID ADDITION 

PROJECT AREA “N” (735 Sunrise)


